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EBS Install Base (CSI)

No. Views Description

1 CSI Instance Contacts

This view returns information about contacts
associated with a party for an item instance.
This information was supplied in the Party
Contacts section on the Item Instance Details
page of Oracle Install Base. A record is
returned for each combination of a contact
number, an item instance number, and a
contact relationship type.

2 CSI Instance Parties

This view returns information about parties
associated with item instances. This
information was supplied in the Parties section
on the Item Instance Details page of Oracle
Install Base. A record is returned for each
combination of a party number, a party
relationship type, and an item instance
number.

3 CSI Instance Party Accts

This view returns information about item
instances and their relationships. This
information was supplied in the Item Instance
Configuration page of Oracle Install Base. A
record is returned for each combination of an
item instance number, a related item instance
number, and a relationship name.

4 CSI Instance Relationships

This view returns information about repair
orders associated with item instances. This
information is displayed on the Repair Orders
section on the Item Instance Details page of
Install Base and the Repair Orders window of
Depot Repair. A record is returned for each
combination of an item instance number and a
repair order number.

5 CSI Instance Repair Orders

This view returns information about item
instances affected by sales orders. This
information is displayed on the General
Attributes section on the Item Instance Details
page of Install Base and was supplied in the
Order Information and Line Items tabs of the
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Sales Order window of Order Management. A
record is returned for each combination of an
item instance number, a sales order number,
an IntransitOrderFlag value, and a
SalesOrderFlag value.

6 CSI Instance Sales Orders

This view returns information about service
requests associated with item instances. This
information is displayed on the Service
Requests section on the Item Instance Details
page of Install Base and was supplied in the
Service Request window of TeleService. A
record is returned for each combination of an
item instance number and a service request
number.

7 CSI Instances

This view returns information about item
instances. This information was supplied in the
Item Instance Details page of Oracle Install
Base. A record is returned for each item
instance number.
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