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OCA Order Management (OM)

No.. Views Description

1 OM Fulfillment Lines

This view returns information
about the fulfillment lines
associated with an order line
in Oracle Fusion Order
Management. This
information is accessible
through Order Management
work area > Order
Management work area >
Tasks > Fulfillment Line. A
record is returned for each
combination of a business
unit name, an order number,
an order line number, and a
fulfillment line identifier.

2 OM Fulfillment Task Step Instances

This view returns information
about the fulfillment
orchestration process tasks
and step instances in Oracle
Fusion Order Management.
This information is accessible
through Order Management
work area > Order
Management work area >
Manage Order Orchestration
Processes > Orchestration
Process Number. A record is
returned for each combination
of a business unit name, an
order number, an order line
number, a task name, a task
status name, a step name,
and a step instance detail
identifier.

3 OM Orchestration Process Instances
This view returns information
about orchestration process
instances and associated key
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metrics in Oracle Fusion
Order Management. This
information is accessible
through Order Management
work area > Order
Management work area >
Manage Order Orchestration
Processes. A record is
returned for each process
instance identifier.

4 OM Order Headers

This view returns information
about order headers in Oracle
Fusion Order Management.

This information is accessible
through Order Management
work area > Order
Management work area >
Tasks > Manage Orders.

A record is returned for each
combination of a business
unit name, an order number,
and an order header identifier.

5 OM Order Holds

This view returns information
about holds on order headers,
order lines, and fulfillment
lines in Oracle Fusion Order
Management. This
information is accessible
through Order Management
work area > Order
Management work area >
Tasks > Manage Orders. A
record is returned for each
combination of a business
unit name, an order header
identifier, a line identifier, and
a hold instance identifier.

6 OM Order Lines This view returns information
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about order lines in Oracle
Fusion Order Management.
This information is accessible
through Order Management
work area > Order
Management work area >
Tasks > Manage Orders. A
record is returned for each
combination of a business
unit name, an order number,
an order line number, and an
order header identifier.
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